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New Academic Session 'Praveshotsav' 

The new session begins with Praveshotsav in all 343 schools (primary, upper
primary, secondary and higher secondary) run by the Banswada Pariyojana.
The Vidyarambh Sanskar (ninth rite of sixteen samskaras) of the boys / girls
who have taken admission in the new session on the date declared by the
school is done by the school through ceremony. Like every year, this year too,
from 19 June to 5 July 2019,   Festivities were held in all schools in which
Havan was done by qualified teachers in the presence of school committee
members, teachers, parents and alumni students. The tribal Boys / girls take
admission in the new session with Yajna, Saraswati and Pujan.
During the Praveshotsav program, the teachers are requested to contact the
parents and request to send their boys / girls to the school. The students
studying in the school go from door to door in groups by tying Kalava in the
hands of the parents and requesting them to send their children to school.
Organizing programs such as taking out processions in the village to create the
awareness and decorating the intersections, making rangoli at appropriate
places, staging short plays showing the importance of education in public
places are some of the activities to raise awareness of children education
among tribals.

Subscribe Past Issues Translate

4/8/25, 2:00 PM Banswara Pariyojana Newsletter July 2019

https://mailchi.mp/609c7939d3e0/banswara-pariyojana-newsletter-july-2019 1/5

https://mailchi.mp/609c7939d3e0/banswara-pariyojana-newsletter-july-2019?e=[UNIQID]
http://eepurl.com/dOt7vX
https://us19.campaign-archive.com/home/?u=efd97c7e2da1b5876b8452d67&id=1843733516
javascript:;


Students singing hymns on Praveshotsav

Senior Faculty Training 

In order to preserve the rich heritage of tribal culture Schools, hostels etc.
activities conducted by Banswara pariyojana in the villages predominantly of
Christianity affected. All total of  308 schools are run at  primary level,   38
schools at secondary level, they act as power center for culture augmentation
and support. These centres are looked after by senior functionaries who are
usually headed by or around the same center, and take immediate appropriate
decisions to address social and organization related problems that occur daily
in the area. In all these secondary level schools, a two-day practice session of
teachers instructing students from class 6 to 12 is organized. This year from 27-
28 July 2019such sessions took place at three different places, in which a total
of 208 Acharyas / Didis were present.   These teachers / teachers were
imparted training to the concerned subjects by qualified subject matter experts.
A special 45-minute special prayer meeting was held in schools for better
future of children. Special classes were held on selected subjects to increase
the intellectual level of trainee teachers. There was a mutual discussion on
current topics.
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Attendees of Senior Faculty Training

Plantation Drive

The students studying in schools run by Banswara pariyojana  under the
guidance of the teachers,every year   carry a plantation drive in their schools,
hostels, Sanskar Kendras and temple premises. In which they plant trees from
Guru Purnima to Hariyali Amavasya (16 to 29 July 2019) for the development of
environment. For the protection of the plants, students of big classes were
made tree friends, who would take care of the allotted plant.
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Students planting saplings in school premises during plantation drive
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